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Re: CONFIRMATION ON PAG-IBIG FUND SHORT TERM PAYMENT

1 message

Pasay - Short Term Loans Accounting Division <pasay_stlad@pagibigfund.gov.ph> Tue, Sep 14, 2021 at 11:05 AM
To: "denr_finance4b_hdmf@yahoo.com" <denr_finance4b_hdmf@yahoo.com>, "denr4bpersonnel@yahoo.com"”
<denr4bpersonnel@yahoo.com>, "mimaroparegion@denr.gov.ph" <mimaroparegion@denr.gov.ph>,
"dmg.mimaropa@gmail.com" <dmg.mimaropa@gmail.com>, "adminmar4b@gmail.com" <adminmardb@gmail.com>,
"rosariogulmatico@yahoo.com" <rosariogulmatico@yahoo.com>

Cc: "denr_finance4dB@yahoo.com” <denr_finance4B@yahoo.com>

?Good morning ma'am/sir,
May we follow up below concern.

Thank you!

Chin-chin A. Reyes
Accounting Support Assistant
Pag-IBIG Fund

TAS NCR West - STL Division
422-3000 loc. 60017

From: Pasay - Short Term Loans Accounting Division

Sent: Friday, September 3, 2021 9:06 AM

To: denr_finance4b_hdmf@yahoo.com; denrdbpersonnel@yahoo.com

Cc: denr_finance4B@yahoo.com

Subject: Re: CONFIRMATION ON PAG-IBIG FUND SHORT TERM PAYMENT

Good Day!

May we request your confirmation if the payments below are truly for the following employee(s)' short term loan. If not,
kindly provide the correct name and Pag-IBIG ID number of the employee(s) the amount should be allocated to. Thank you.

Employer: DENR IVB  MIMAROPA

LAST NAME FIRST NAME NAME EXT MIDDLE NAME  REFERENCE NO. TRANSACTION DATE
AMOUNT SCHEME REMARKS

MESINA ELIZABETH MORENO 203500000150351 12/15/2020 4,171.44 MPL FOR
VERIFICATION
MESINA ELIZABETH MORENO 210040000410351 01/04/2021 4,171.44 MPL FOR
VERIFICATION
MESINA ELIZABETH MORENO 211340000130351 05/14/2021 4,171.44 MPL FOR
VERIFICATION
GULMATICO ROSARIO CHENG 211820000160351 01/07/2021 970.49 MPL FOR
VERIFICATION
MESINA ELIZABETH MORENO 211820000160351 01/07/2021 4,171.44 MPL FOR
VERIFICATION

?Joebert Abistros

Accounting Support Assistant
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mailto:denr_finance4B@yahoo.com

In behalf of STL Acct
422-3000 loc 5751 / 552-1159 loc 35

From: Pasay - Short Term Loans Accounting Division

Sent: Friday, August 13, 2021 12:04 PM

To: denr_finance4b_hdmf@yahoo.com; denrdbpersonnel@yahoo.com
Subject: Re: CONFIRMATION ON PAG-IBIG FUND SHORT TERM PAYMENT

Hi Ma'am/Sir,

Good day!

May we follow up below concern.

Thank you!?

Joebert Abistros

Accounting Support Assistant

In behalf of STL Acct

422-3000 loc 5751 / 552-1159 loc 35

From: Pasay - Short Term Loans Accounting Division

Sent: Friday, July 30, 2021 11:54 AM

To: denr_finance4b_hdmf@yahoo.com; denrdbpersonnel@yahoo.com
Subject: CONFIRMATION ON PAG-IBIG FUND SHORT TERM PAYMENT

Good Day!

May we request your confirmation if the payments below are truly for the following employee(s) short term loan. If not,
kindly provide the correct name and Pag-IBIG ID number of the employee(s) the amount should be allocated to. Thank you.

Employer: DENR IVB  MIMAROPA

LAST NAME FIRST NAME EXT NAME MIDDLE NAME  REFERENCE NO. TRANSACTION DATE
AMOUNT SCHEME REMARKS

MESINA ELIZABETH ? MORENO 203500000150351 12/15/2020 4,171.44 MPL NO RECORD FOUND
MESINA ELIZABETH ? MORENO 210040000410351 01/04/2021 4,171.44 MPL NO RECORD FOUND
MESINA ELIZABETH ? MORENO 211340000130351 05/14/2021 4,171.44 MPL NO RECORD FOUND

Joebert Abistros

Accounting Support Assistant

In behalf of STL Acct

422-3000 loc 5751 / 552-1159 loc 35
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The information contained in this communication is privileged and confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom it is addressed and others authorized to receiwe it. If you are not the intended recipient you must
not disclose or use the information contained in it. If you have received this email in error please notify us immediately by
return email and delete the document. Pag-IBIG Fund is neither liable for the proper and complete transmission of the
information nor for any delay in its receipt. Pag-IBIG Fund accepts no liability for any damage caused by this email or its
attachments due to viruses, interference, interception, corruption or unauthorized access.



