
Republic of the Philippines 

REGIONAL DEVELOPMENT COUNCIL 

MIMAROPA Region   Calapan City 

 

EXCERPTS FROM THE MINUTES OF THE THIRD  QUARTER RDC FULL 
COUNCIL MEETING HELD ON SEPTEMBER 3, 2021 THROUGH VIDEO 

CONFERENCING 
 

RDC Resolution No. 2021-076-1004 
 

APPROVING THE INCLUSION OF THE PROPOSED ESTABLISHMENT OF 
LIWASAN NG MAMAMAYAN: ORIENTAL MINDORO PEOPLE’S PARK AND 

PUBLIC PLAZA IN THE MIMAROPA REGIONAL DEVELOPMENT 
INVESTMENT PROGRAM (RDIP) 2017-2022 

 
WHEREAS, the Regional Development Counci l (RDC) is mandated under 
Executive Order No. 325, s .1996 to review and endorse proposed programs, 
activ i ties, and projects  of loca l government units requir ing nat ional 
government financial exposure which may come in  the form of guarantees, 
national government budget  appropriations or subsid ies, among others;  
 
WHEREAS, the Provincial  Government of Or ienta l Mindoro is proposing for  
the establ ishment  of the L iwasan ng Mamamayan: The Or ienta l Mindoro 
People’s Park and Public Plaza in Camilmil,  Calapan City;  
 
WHEREAS, the proposed project involves the development of a 5,000 square 
meter area into a park and public  plaza amounting  to ₱hp70 mil l ion for  
funding under the Department of Tourism (DOT)  MIMAROPA and the 
Department of Public Works and Highways (DPWH) MIMAROPA ; 
 
WHEREAS, the project aims to: 1)  provide an alternat ive venue for social or  
special events as well as promotion and marketing of loca l products;  and 2)  
provide livel ihood and employment opportunities for  loca l residents;  
 
WHEREAS, the Economic Development Committee (EDC), during i ts  th ird  
quarter meeting on August 05  through Zoom video conference , reviewed and 
deliberated the proposed pro ject  in  terms of compliance with  the documentary 
requirements of the RDC and i ts a lignment  with  the goals and object ives of  
the MIMAROPA Regional Development Plan (RDP) 2017 -2022; 
 
WHEREAS, the EDC recommended RDC endorsement of the proposed 
Orienta l Mindoro Peoples’ Park and Public  Plaza  for inc lusion in the 
MIMAROPA RDIP 2017-2022; 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, to approve the inclusion of  the 
proposed establishment o f the Liwasan ng Mamamayan: The Or ienta l Mindoro 
People’s Park and Public Plaza in Camilmil, Calapan City  in the MIMAROPA 
Regional Development Investment Program 2017-2022. 
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